
Dockside House, Chelsea Creek
London SW6



Dockside House, Chelsea Creek 
London, SW6

£1,154 Per Week 

RIGHT TO PARK FOR 1 CAR - A stunning and
spacious Two-bedroom apartment 852sqft
(79.2sqm) situated on the 5th floor within
Dockside House. The apartment offers furnished
accommodation comprising of a spacious open
plan lounge & modern kitchen with integrated
appliances, spacious balcony. Two double
bedrooms with the master benefitting from an
ensuite, family bathroom. Chelsea Creek offers a
24-hour concierge service, indoor residents'
swimming pool, spa, and treatment rooms, while
the fashionable King's Road, with an array of
designer shops, restaurants and cafes is a short
journey away. Fulham Broadway is also nearby
from Imperial Wharf over ground station which
is one stop from both West Brompton station
(district line) and Clapham Junction.

Please note furniture may differ to that shown in
the current photos.

Deposit – 6 weeks 
12-Month Contract 
Council Tax – London Borough Of
Hammersmith & Fulham – Band G 

EPC – 86 (B)

• Stunning Two Bedroom Apartment

• 852sqft (79.2m)

• Right To Park For 1 Car

• Furnished

• Spacious Open Plan Lounge & Kitchen

• Located On The 5th Floor

• Spacious Balcony

• Onsite Facilities – Gym , Swimming Pool &
Treatment Rooms & 24-Hour Concierge

• Available Now To View With Garton Jones
Based Onsite At Chelsea Creek

• EPC – 86 (B)

11 Park Street
Chelsea Creek
London
SW6 2FS

Sales +44 (0) 20 7824 7090
paul@gartonjones.com
www.gartonjones.com

EPC certificate available on request.






